

BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

Preliminary Bid Tabulation for **Bid No. 01-2019**

Supply and Delivery of **Aluminum Sulfate**

for the period **FYE 2019/2020**

Bid Open Date **Tuesday, April 2, 2019 at 9:00 PDT**

Name of Bidder	44% - 49% Liquid Solution Unit Price Per Gallon					Optional 5% Acidized Unit Price Per Gal	Optional 7% Acidized Unit Price Per Gal
	Central Valley	North Bay	Sacramento	South Bay	Tri Valley	North Bay	North Bay
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	\$0.77170	\$0.76170	\$0.74180	\$0.78380	\$0.77170	\$0.80840	\$0.88640
Thatcher Company of California, Inc.	\$1.01520	\$1.01520	\$1.01520	\$1.01520	\$1.01520	\$1.49790	\$1.57160
Univar USA Inc.	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.

The listing of a bid should not be construed as any indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

Per Section 2.16 Method of Award

Bids may be awarded by the participating BACC agencies to the lowest, responsive, and responsible bidder meeting the specifications for bulk loads for the chemical. The lowest responsive bidder will be determined by multiplying the estimated annual quantity for each participating BACC agency by the bid price for their region, and adding up the aggregate cost to all of the participating agencies in the regions. The single bid that results in the lowest overall cost to the participating agencies as a group will be determined by BACC to be the low bid, assuming the bid is determined by BACC to be complete and in compliance with the bid requirements.

BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

Preliminary Bid Tabulation for **Bid No. 05-2019**

Supply and Delivery of **Citric Acid**

for the period **FYE 2019/2020**

Bid Open Date **Tuesday, April 2, 2019 at 9:00 PDT**

Name of Bidder	48% - 52% Liquid Unit price per gallon			Crystalline Powder Unit price per dry lb
	Central Valley	North Bay	Sacramento	Tri Valley
Univar USA Inc.	\$7.05000	\$7.05000	\$7.05000	No bid
Pacific Star Chemical	\$7.26000	\$6.64000	\$7.55000	\$0.95000
Brenntag Pacific, Inc.	\$6.55000	\$5.79000	\$6.55000	\$1.09000

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.

The listing of a bid should not be construed as any indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

Per Section 2.16 Method of Award

Bids may be awarded by the participating BACC agencies to the lowest, responsive, and responsible bidder meeting the specifications for bulk loads for the chemical. The lowest responsive bidder will be determined by multiplying the estimated annual quantity for each participating BACC agency by the bid price for their region, and adding up the aggregate cost to all of the participating agencies in the regions. The single bid that results in the lowest overall cost to the participating agencies as a group will be determined by BACC to be the low bid, assuming the bid is determined by BACC to be complete and in compliance with the bid requirements.

BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

Preliminary Bid Tabulation for **Bid No. 13-2019**

Supply and Delivery of **Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%**

for the period **FYE 2019/2020**

Bid Open Date **Tuesday, April 2, 2019 at 9:00 PDT**

Name of Bidder	Unit price per gallon								Optional Bid Item IN CARBOYS Unit price per gal		Optional Bid Item 5.25% Unit price per gal
	Central Valley	East Bay	Marin Sonoma Napa	North Bay	Peninsula	Sacramento	South Bay	Tri Valley	Marin Sonoma Napa	Sacramento	Sacramento
Univar	\$0.68730	\$0.65820	\$0.70010	\$0.67470	\$0.69760	\$0.78630	\$0.64130	\$0.67220	no bid	no bid	no bid
Olin Chlor	\$0.69900	\$0.69900	\$0.75900	\$0.71900	\$0.71900	\$0.73900	\$0.71900	\$0.67900	no bid	no bid	\$0.65000

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.

The listing of a bid should not be construed as any indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

Per Section 2.16 Method of Award

Bids may be awarded by the participating BACC agencies to the lowest, responsive, and responsible bidder for each listed region meeting the specifications for bulk loads for the chemical. The lowest responsive bidder for this chemical will be determined for each region listed on the Bid Form. The bidder that meets the specifications and submits the lowest overall bid price for a particular region may be awarded the bid by the participating agencies in that region, assuming the bid is determined by BACC to be complete and in compliance with the bid requirements. The lowest overall bid price for each region will be determined by multiplying the estimated annual quantity for each participating agency within the particular region by the bid prices for the region, and adding up the aggregate cost.