

BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

Preliminary Bid Tabulation for **Bid No. 01-2018**

Supply and Delivery of **Aluminum Sulfate** for Fiscal Year 2018/2019

Open Date: Tuesday, April 10, 2018 at 9:00 a.m. PDT

Name of Bidder	Unit Price Per Gallon					2% Acidized Unit Price Per Gal	5% Acidized Unit Price Per Gal
	Marin Sonoma Napa	North Bay	Sacramento	South Bay	Tri Valley	South Bay	South Bay
Univar USA Inc.	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Thatcher Company of California, Inc.	\$0.74050	\$0.71950	\$0.70660	\$0.76740	\$0.75180	\$0.90800	\$0.88340
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	\$0.67670	\$0.68750	\$0.62230	\$0.70810	\$0.81520	\$0.68240	\$0.64280
APPARENT LOW BID	\$0.67670	\$0.68750	\$0.62230	\$0.70810	\$0.75180	\$0.68240	\$0.64280

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.

The listing of a bid should not be construed as any indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

Preliminary Bid Tabulation for **Bid No. 05-2018**

Supply and Delivery of **Citric Acid** for Fiscal Year 2018/2019

Open Date: Tuesday, April 10, 2018 at 9:00 a.m. PDT

Name of Bidder	Unit price per gallon			Unit price per dry lb
	Central Valley	North Bay	Sacramento	Tri Valley
Brenntag Pacific, Inc.	\$7.10000	\$5.67000	\$7.85000	\$0.98500
Northstar Chemical, Inc.	\$5.59000	\$5.55000	\$6.27000	\$0.95000
Univar USA Inc.	\$7.62000	\$7.62000	\$7.62000	no bid
APPARENT LOW BID	\$5.59000	\$5.55000	\$6.27000	\$0.95000

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.

The listing of a bid should not be construed as any indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

Preliminary Bid Tabulation for **Bid No. 13-2018**

Supply and Delivery of **Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%** for Fiscal Year 2018/2019

Open Date: Tuesday, April 10, 2018 at 9:00 a.m. PDT

Name of Bidder	Unit price per gallon							Optional Bid Item IN DRUMS Unit price per gal	Optional Bid Item IN CARBOYS Unit price per gal	
	Central Valley	East Bay	Marin Sonoma Napa	North Bay	Peninsula	Sacramento	South Bay	Tri Valley	North Bay	South Bay
Olin Chlor Alkali Products	\$0.66900	\$0.66900	\$0.73900	\$0.68900	\$0.72900	\$0.66400	\$0.65900	\$0.64900	no bid	no bid
Univar USA Inc.	\$0.65520	\$0.65390	\$0.66530	\$0.64690	\$0.65230	\$0.77490	\$0.60530	\$0.67220	no bid	no bid
APPARENT LOW BID	\$0.65520	\$0.65390	\$0.66530	\$0.64690	\$0.65230	\$0.66400	\$0.60530	\$0.64900	\$0.00000	\$0.00000

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.

The listing of a bid should not be construed as any indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.